
By Flesh 

By Law 

By the Holy Spirit 



1.  The Holy Spirit leads us by Biblical 
truth!  

2.  The Holy Spirit leads us by
Spiritual Love.

3.  The Holy Spirit leads you super 
naturally from within.

Do you believe that HS leads     

supernaturally? 



• 2 Cor. 3:6 who also made us adequate as 
servants of a new covenant, not of the 
letter, law but of the Spirit; for the letter 
kills, but the Spirit gives life. 



• Matt. 4:4 But He answered & said, "It is 
written, 'Man Shall Not Live on Bread 
Alone, But on Every Word that proceeds 
out of the mouth of God.'"

• Jere. 15:16 Thy words were found & I ate 
them, & Thy words became for me a joy & 
the delight of my heart; For I have been 
called by Thy name, O LORD God of hosts.

• we are called by His name: Christian –little 
Christ 



• Ezek. 3:3 & He said to me, "Son of man, 
feed your stomach, & fill your body with 
this scroll which I am giving you." Then I 
ate it, and it was sweet as honey in my 
mouth.  

• Job 23:12 "I have not departed from the 
command of His lips; I have treasured the  
words of His mouth more than my 
necessary food.



• Our breath is Holy Spirit 

• Our food is Word of God

• Our life is to Glorify Jesus Christ 



peripateo

stoicheo


